SUMMARY
DHCD 2012 Code Change Cycle
Workgroup #2 Subgroup: Assisted Living Facilities (ALF)
January 15, 2013
Virginia Housing Center
10:00a.m. - 2:00p.m.

Workgroup #2 Subgroup (ALF): Group I-1, Condition 1 & Condition 2

Attached: List of attendees
Handouts distributed before & during this meeting

Meeting Summary:

Emory Rodgers introduced Dan Purgiel, an architect from Oregon and prime patron for
the new 2015 ICC IBC ALF 1-1 Condition 1 & Condition 2 code change. Dan gave an
overview of his successful code change at the national level. It has been an endeavor,
of over 6 years, to bring consensus among operators, design professionals, licensure
agencies, and building and fire code officials.

Dan's comprehensive overview and his experiences with states including Oregon,
Georgia, and New York moving towards early statewide adoptions of the code change
resulted in the attendees at the subgroup meeting agreeing to support the next stage of
drafting a proposed code change for Virginia.

Dan acknowledged that each state will most likely have state amendments. Virginia
would be no different. We would now define that an R-4, R-5, and 1-1 can have up to 5
residents that need assistance in an evacuation or emergency. Those 5 residents
would have to be on a floor at grade level.

Staff will proceed with a code change that adds the new [-1 Condition 2 in a new section
of 308. The code change will also revise the I-1 Condition 1 so that 5 residents may
now reside in these ambulatory facilities. 1t will also modify I-1 Condition 2 and R-4
Condition 2 that “limited verbal or physical assistance” meaning that the residents, for
the purposes of complying with USBC and the DSS UAI are non-ambulatory with
custodial care, but not medical care that would be provided in Group I-2, licensed by
VDH.

For now, the USBC Virginia Rehabilitation Code/IEBC will not be modified substantially,
with the exception of linking back to the USBC VCC. Some replication of the [-1
Condition 2 requirements found in the VCC will need to be added to the VRC where
conversions of or additions to existing buildings are being done.

The topic of hospice was brought forward, but there will be no change to the VDH
licensed facilities. An R-4, category for hospice, may need to be left as a stand-alone
section.



Fire drills were also discussed and some changes are being proposed for the 2015 IFC.

Any additional 2012 code changes for the |-1 occupancies would not be a part of this
effort and if any code change is proposed, it would need to be filed by July 1, 2013.

Staff will do a revised code change for distribution. Workgroups #2 & #4 will consider
this code change at the February 28" meeting, scheduled to be held at the Virginia
Housing Center.

Open Issues:

Coordinate current USBC text for licensed ALFs of 8 or less in R-3 and R-5
occupancies that are Condition 2, where all 8 would need assistance versus the current
allowance of 5 residents.

Consider perhaps having Condition 2 as a stand-alone in Chapter 4.

More extensive training will likely be necessary for operators, design professionals, and
building and fire code officials to understand the flexibility that this code change offers to
operators in the construction of a new facility or for conversions or additions to existing
buildings.



LAME _EMAIL DERT

PAN PURGIEL dpurgre\@lrsarchitects.com LRS ARCHITESS
Sieu raps 4 Jennysies @ coxt.net TYG - Aei -
l)‘em&,\u, ﬂ bic >
oA Ri71262 7u e Fiee [%Mﬂﬂ <
(,\,w%. wSEMO
Lacey Drocke DHey DD
Jdennifer Reeves DECD DHCD
Sonoh Norris DD N
Qrrelde Felley

1o & 1 nvg.G a VD33
ﬁox\/@{'f,«dws m%%gn-m 5 ':ﬂ"ﬁ‘f G U§'CMO
VA
%m /( /4{»70 M Ce%ﬁaﬁ

Kepoex ?Awos \SAA
Mumxw, ?Evm;% Mreﬂ A ka0 DUt Waf &7 M
/d/a Davis- %A fara. dav:sé)rw net  VKCA / Operatsr

,u/u /L 5w6~,w7, 20/0_ Y¢S £



AGENDA
DHCD 2012 Code Change Cycle

Workgroup 2 Subgroup: ALF’s I-1 Conditioned 1 and 2

2012 USBC/IBC Code Change

January 15, 2013 - 10:00 a.m. — 2:00 p.m.

Location: Virginia Housing Center, 4224 Cox Rd.,

Glen Allen, VA 23060

Lunch provided by reservation only. Please email

Janice.firestone@dhcd.virginia.gov by January 8" if you would like to have a

Agenda

lunch ordered for you.

1. Review of G31 2015 ICC/IBC ALF 1-1 Conditions 1 and 2 and any related code
changes review. Overview to be provided by Dan Purgiel, author of the code
changes.

2. 2012 USBC/IBC draft code change for G-31 (in handout). Some decisions to be
made are:

What to have

Retention of current I-1 17 and over

Sprinklers with 5 residents needing assistance

Where R-4 allows 9 to 16 residents 5 assistance with sprinklers and 5 on
grade floor

Where R-3 or R-5 1-8 residents with up to 5 residents needing assistance
with sprinklers.

Do we delete our requirements or some parts thereof or just use the I-1
conditioned 1 & 2 and the R-4 Condition 1 and 2? The draft will have to
be amended for what the stakeholders/operators want to see as
requirements.

3. Next steps:

February 28, 2013 Workgroup 2 - review code change for consensus
among stakeholders

March 25" BHCD’s CSC review

April 22™ consideration for 2012 USBC VCC IBC proposed regulations

4. New Business

5. Adjournment



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2012 Code Change Cycle

Code Change Number;___Draft December 18,
2012

Proponent Information (Check one): [ Jindividual []Government Entity ~ [_]Company

Name: DHCD staff, for consideration by the sub-workgroup for Assisted Living Facilities

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): IBC Sections 202, 308.3, 308.4, 308.6, 310.6,420, 504, 709.5, 903.2.6, 903.2.8,1018

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

See attached. Assisted Living Facilities licensed by the Department of Social Services

Supporting Statement (including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

To be added at a later date.

Submittal Information

Date Submitted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.
Please submit the proposal to:
DHCD DBFR SBCO (State Building Codes Office)

600 East Main Street Email Address: Vernon.hodge@dhcd.virginia.gov
Suite 300 Fax Number: (804) 371-7092
Richmond, VA 23219 Phone Numbers: (804) 371-7150
N
“ VIRGINIA
ssDHCD




Change Section 202 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

24-HOUR GARE BASIS. The actual time that a person is an occupant within a facility for the purpose of
receiving care. It shall not include a facility that is open for 24 hours and is capable of providing care
to someone visiting the facility during any segment of the 24 hours.

CUSTODIAL CARE. Assistance with day-to-day living tasks; such as assistance with cooking, taking
medication, bathing, using toilet facilities and other tasks of daily living. Custodial care include includes

occupants whe that have the ability to respond to emergency situations and evacuate at a slower rate

and/or who have mental and psychiatric complications.

GROUP HOME. A facility for social rehabilitation, substance abuse or mental health problems that
contains a group housing arrangement that provides custodial care but does not provide asute
medical care.

Change Section 308.3 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

308.3 Institutional Group I-1. This occupancy shall include buildings, structures or portions thereof
for more than 16 persons,_excluding staff, who reside on a 24 hour basis in a supervised environment
and receive custodial care. The-persens-receiving-care-are-capable-of selfpreservation. Buildings of
Group |-1 shall be classified as one of the occupancy conditions indicated in Sections 308.3.1, 308.3.2
or 420. This group shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Alcohol and drug centers
Assisted living facilities
Congregate care facilities
Convalescent facilities

Group homes
Halfway houses

Residential board and sustedial care facilities
Social rehabilitation facilities

Exception: 308.3.1 In Group I-1 occupancies, not more than five of the residents may require
physical assistance from the staff to respond to an emergency situation when all the residents that
may require the physical assistance reside on a single level of exit discharge. (Should this be an
exception to Condition 2 keeping USBC 5 residents and wouldn’t then have to do compartments and
the other new requirements if only did the 5 residents?)

308.3.2 1-1 Condition 1. This occupancy condition shall include buildings in which all persons
receiving custodial care who, without any assistance, are capable of responding to an emergency
situation to complete building evacuation.

30832 308.3.3 Nine to sixteen persons receiving custodial care. A facility such-as-abeve, housing not
fewer than nine and not more than 16 persons receiving sueh custodial care, shall be classified as
Group R-4.

308-3:1 308.3.4 Eight or fewer persons receiving custodial care. A facility such-as-the-above with five or
fewer persons receiving sueh custodial care shall be classified as Group R-3 or shall comply with the R-
57 International Residential Code provided an automatic sprinkler system is installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.3 or with Section P2904 of the International Residential Code.



Change Section 308.4 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

308.4 Institutional Group 1-2. This occupancy shall include buildings and structures used for medical
care on a 24-hour basis for more than five persons who are incapable of self preservation. This group
shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Foster care facilities
Detoxification facilities
Hospitals

Nursing homes
Psychiatric hospitals

308.4.1 Five or fewer persons receiving medical care. A facility such-as-the-abeve with five or fewer persons
receiving sush medical care shall be classified as Group R-3 or shall comply with the R-57?
International Residential Code provided an automatic sprinkler system is installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.3 or with Section P2904 of the /nternational Residential Code.

Change Section 310.6 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

310.6 Residential Group R-4 . This occupancy shall include buildings, structures or portions thereof for
more than nine but not more than 16 persons, excluding staff, who reside on a 24-hour basis in

a supervised residential environment and receive cusfodial care.-Fhe-person+receiving-care-are
capable-efselfpreservation. Buildings of Group R-4 shall be classified as one of the occupancy
conditions indicated in Sections 310.1 R-4 ( five exceptions keep), 310.6.1 or 420 move? This group

shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Alcohol and drug centers
Assisted living facilities
Congregate care facilities
Convalescent facilities
Group homes

Halfway houses
Residential board and custedial care
facilities Social rehabilitation facilities

Group R-4 occupancies shall meet the requirements for construction as defined for Group R-3 R-57?,

except as otherwise provided for in this code, or shall comply with the IRC provided the building is
protected by an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.2.8.

310.6.1 R-4 Condition 1. This occupancy condition shall include buildings in which all persons
receiving custodial care, who without any assistance, are capable of responding to an emergency

situation to complete building evacuation.

Exceptions: 1 to 5 remain same and this is section with the need for most work to integrate Conditions
1&2

Appears R-4 condition 1 is partly USBC Exceptions #3 all capable of self-evacuation and then #4 can
have 5 residents needing assistance on grade floor, with sprinklers. Confusing now?

Options to consider: Keep these exceptions or perhaps delete #3 and 4 replacing with R-4 condition 1 or
some combination. Keep exceptions 1, 2, and 5.



310.7 Residential Group R-5. (The following are existing VCC amendments to this section of the IBC
with changes to sections numbers). Residential occupancies in detached one- and two-family dwellings,
townhouses and accessory structures within the scope of the International Residential Code, also
referred to as the “IRC".

The construction of R-5 structures shall comply with the IRC. The amendments to the IRC set out in
Section 348-6 310.10 shall be made to its use as part of this code. In addition, all references to Section
101.2 in the IBC relating to construction of such structures subject to the IRC shall be considered to be
references in this section. R-5 correlation with G31 condition 2

310.7.1 Additional Requirements. (Keep existing VCC language).
310.8 Family Day Homes. (Keep existing language).

310.9 Radon-resistant construction in Group R-3 and R-4 structures. (Keep existing language).

Change Section 420 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

420.1 General. Occupancies in Groups I-1, R-1, R-2 and 4 R-3 and R-4 shall comply with the
provisions of Sections 420.1 through /420-5 420.6 and other applicable provisions of this code.
420. 4/308.3.2 I-1 and R-4 Condition 2. This occupancy condition shall include buildings in which

there are any persons receiving custodial care who require limited verbal or physical assistance
whlle responding to an emerqencv S|tuat|on to complete building evacuatlon—340-6—2—cendmga

420-4-Autematic-sprinkler-system 420.4.1 Smoke barriers in Group I-1 Condition 2. Smoke barriers
shall be provided in Group I-1 Condition 2 to subdivide every story used by persons receiving care,
treatment or sleeping and to provide other stories with an occupant load of 50 or more persons, into
no fewer than two smoke compartments. Such_stories shall be divided into smoke compartments with
an area of not more than 22,500 square feet (2092 m*) and the travel distance from any pointin a

smoke compartment to a smoke barrier door shall not exceed 200 feet (60 960 mm). The smoke

barrier shall be in accordance with Section 709.

420.4.2 Refuge area. Refuge areas shall be provided within each smoke compartment. The size of the
refuge area shall accommodate the occupants and care recipients from the adjoining smoke
compartment. Where a smoke compartment is adjoined by two or more smoke compartments, the
minimum area of the refuge area shall accommodate the largest occupant load of the adjoining
compartments. The size of the refuge area shall provide the following:

1. Not less than 15 net square feet (1.4 mz) for each care recipient.
2.

Not less than 6 net square feet (0.56 m“) for other occupants.

Areas or spaces permitted to be included in the calculation of the refuge area are corridors,

lounge or dining areas and other low hazard areas.
420-4 420.5 Automatic sprinkler system. (No change to text) what is this?
420. 5 option 903.2.8.3 Group R-4 Condition 2. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with

903.3.1.2 shall be permitted in Group R-4 Condition 2. Attics shall be protected in accordance
with Sections 903.2.8.3.1 or 903.2.8.3.2.




420.5.1/903.2.8.3.1_Attics used for living purposes, storage or fuel fired equipment. Attics used for living purposes,

storage or fuel fired equipment shall be protected throughout with automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with 903.3.1.2.

420.52/903.2.8.32 Attics not used for living purposes, storage or fue! fired equipment . Attics not used for

living purposes, storage or fuel fired equipment shall be protected in accordance with one of the
following:

1. Attics protected throughout by a heat detector system arranged to activate the building fire
alarm system in accordance with Section 907.2.10.

2. Attics constructed of non-combustible materials.

3. Attics constructed of fire-retardant-treated wood framing complying with Section 2303.2.

4. The automatic fire sprinkler system shall be extended to provide protection throughout the

attic _space.

420.5 420.6 Smoke detection and fire alarm system. Smoke-detection-and fire alarm systems and smoke
alarms Fire alarm systems and smoke alarms shall be provided in Group I-1, R-1,. and R-2 and
Groug R-4 occupancies in accordance with Sections 907.2.6, 907.2.8, and 907.2.9 and 907.2.10,
respectively. Single-or multiple- station smoke alarms shall be provided in Groups 1-1, R-2, R-3 and
R-4 in accordance with Section 907.2.11.

R-5 how cover?

Change Section 504 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

504.2 Automatic sprinkler system increase. Where a building is equipped throughout with an approved
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, the value specified in Table 503 for
maximum building height is increased by 20 feet (6096 mm) and the maximum number of stories is
increased by one. These increases are permitted in addition to the building area increase in
accordance with Sections 506.2 and 5063. For Group R buildings equipped throughout with an
approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2, the value specified in
Table 503 for maximum building height is increased by 20 feet (6096 mm) and the maximum number
of stories is increased by one, but shall not exceed 60 feet (18 288 mm) or four stories, respectively.

Exception: The use of an automnatic sprinkler system to increase building heights shall not be
permitted for the following conditions: R-5 covered?

1. Buildings, or portions of buildings, classified as a Group -1 Condition 2, of Type IIB,
I, IV or V construction or Group 12 eeeupaney occupancies of Type IIB, lll, IV or V
construction.

2. Buildings, or portions of buildings, classified as a Group H-1, H-2, H-3 or H-5
occupancy.

3. Buildings where an automatic sprinkler system is substituted for fire-resistance rated
construction in accordance with table 601, Note d.

Change Section 709.5 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

709.5 Openings. Openings in a smoke barrier shall be protected in accordance with Section 716.

Exceptions:



1. In Group I-1 Condition 2, Group 1-2 and ambulatory care facilities, where doors are
installed across corridors, a pair of opposite- swinging doors without a center mullion shall
be installed having vision panels with fire-protection- rated glazing materials in fire-
protection-rated frames, the area of which shall not exceed that tested. The doors shall be
close fitting within operational tolerances, and shall not have undercuts in excess of 3/4-
inch, louvers or grilles. The doors shall have head and jamb stops, astragals or rabbets
at meeting edges and shall be automatic-closing by smoke detection in accordance
with Section 716.5.9.3. Where permitted by the door manufacturer's listing, positive-
latching devices are not required.

2. In Group I-1 Condition 2, Group 1-2 and ambulatory care facilities, horizontal sliding

doors installed in accordance with Section 1008.1.4.3 and protected in accordance
with Section 716.

Change Section 903.2.6 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

903.2.6 Group l. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings with a Group | fire
area.

Exceptions:

1. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 shall
be permltted in Group -1 Condmon 1 facnlmes

2 3 An automatic sprinkler system is not required where Group -4 day care facmtles are at the
level of exit discharge and where every room where care is provided has at least one
exterior exit door.

3 4. In buildings where Group |-4 day care is provided on levels other than the level of exit
discharge, an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 903.3.1.1 shall be installed
on the entire floor where care is provided and all floors between the level of care and the
level of exit discharge, all floors below the level of exit discharge, other than areas
classified as an open parking garage.

Change Section 903.2.8 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3 shall be
provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area.

903.2.8.1 Group R-3 or-R-4 cengregate-residence. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
903.3.1.3 shall be permitted in Group R-3—e~R-4-congregate-residence-with-16-orfewerresidents-

903.2.8.2 Carefasilities Group R4 Condition 1. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance
with 903.3.1.3 shall be permitted in Group R-4 Condition 1. What about 2908

803-2.8:2 903.2.8.4 Care facilities. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with 903.3.1.3 shall
be permitted in care facilities with 12/10 or fewer individuals in a single family dwelling. What about
29087

Change Section 903.3.1.3 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:




903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems installed in one and two-family dwellings,
Group R-3, ard R-4 eengregateresidences_Condition 1 and townhouses shall be permitted to be installed
throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D. what about 29087

Change Section 907.2.6.1 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

907.2.6.1 Group I-1. In Group I-1 occupancies, an automatic smoke detection system shall be installed in
corridors, waiting areas open to corridors and habitable spaces other than sleeping units and kitchens.
The system shall be activated in accordance with Section 907.5.

Exceptions:

1. For Group -1 Condition 1 smoke Smeke detection in habitable spaces is not required
where the facility is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

2. Smoke detection is not required for exterior balconies

Change Section 1018.1 of the VCC (IBC) to read as follows:

1018.1 Construction. Corridors shall be fire-resistance rated in accordance with Table 1018.1. The
corridor walls required to be fire-resistance rated shall comply with Section 708 for fire partitions.

Exceptions:

1. Afire-resistance rating is not required for corridors in an occupancy in Group E where each
room that is used for instruction has at least one door opening directly to the exterior
and rooms for assembly purposes have at least one-half of the required means of egress
doors opening directly to the exterior. Exterior doors specified in this exception are required
to be at ground level.

2. A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors contained within a dwelling or sleeping
unit in an accupancy in Group -1 and Group R.

3. Afire-resistance rating is not required for corridors in open parking garages.

4, A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors in an occupancy in Group B which is a
space requiring only a single means of egress complying with Section 1015.1.

5. Corridors adjacent to the exterior walls of buildings shall be permitted to have unprotected
openings on unrated exterior walls where unrated walls are permitted by Table 602 and
unprotected openings are permitted by Table 705.8.

Supporting Statement;

The current IBC requires all occupants receiving Custodial Care to be able to evacuate on their own without any assistance from
others. Most state Custodia!l Care (assisted living/ residential care/ group homes) licensing agencies allow occupants who require
limited assistance with evacuation.' The lack of consistency between what the states allow and the IBC Custodial Care provisions
causes inconsistent application of the IBC.z This proposal resolves that conflict and will result in better consistency. The proposal
integrates allowing both residents who require limited assistance with evacuation and those that do not in Custodial Care
occupancies.

The proposed Group I-1 and R-4 custodial care revisions accomplish the following:
It provides "condition classifications" for both Groups I-1 and R-4. It makes Condition 1 for the buildings, as currently
allowed, with residents capable of responding on their own during emergencies. It adds a Condition 2 for buildings
residents who may require some assistance with evacuation. It retains the USBC 5 residents can be in the new I-1,
R-4 or R-5 needing assistance. It retains the USBC for up to eight residents being in an unsprinkled R-S if all the
residents are capable of self-preservation.

P



It adds to the new Group 1-1 Condition 2, four more stringent requirements due to the new resident type allowed, in
addition to the existing current Group I-1 Condition 1 requirements: story limitations, smoke barriers, increased sprinkler
protection, attic protection and additional smoke detection.

It adds to the new Group R-4 Condition 2, due to the new resident type allowed, two more stringent requirements in
addition to the capable Group R-4 Condition 1 requirements: story limitations, and additional attic detection or protection,
considering the smaller facilities.

It clarifies in the revised Custodial Care definition and In Group I-1 and R-4 Condition 2 occupancies that they are not
Group 1-2, which provides Medical Care. Group I-1 Custodial Care has persons with some physical or mental limitations,
who may require iimited assistance in emergency evacuation, but who are still capable enough to participate in complete
buiiding evacuation during emergencies. This limit of the level of care or resident type in Group I-1 and R-4 does not
include Group 1-2 higher acuity occupants who require fuil nursing care or Medical Care as defined. Those receiving
Medical Care in Group 1-2 may be bedridden during emergencles, may be on life support systems, or may be
semlconscious or unconscious, all in which evacuation concepts allows for defend in place strategies.

The substantiation for both the IBC and correlating IFC changes relating to this Group I-1/R4 proposal are integrated
below in IBC section order, to provide a comprehensive correlation of both sets of changes for both codes.

Group I-1 Condition 2 & Group 1-2 similarity & difference: Group I-1 Condition 2 adds smoke barriers like Group 1-2
medical care occupancies. Smoke barriers provide temporary protection for custodial care residents that require
assistance from others in an emergency. These Group I-1 facilities still eventually complete building evacuation and
residents still participate in fire drills as in the current IFC, versus the "defend in place" and non fire drill participation in
Group 1-2 Medical Care facilities. The proponent is also proposing minor Group 1-1 Condition 2 changes in the IFC, still
requiring fire drill participation, and full evacuation, while utilizing smoke compartments to allow for staged building
evacuation.
Group I-1 Condition 2 & Group 1-2 differences: Group I-1 Condition 2 still has approprlate corridor protections,
dwelling and sleeping unit separation, smoke detection, and unit smoke alarms, which Group 1-2 Medica! Care does not
require. This is due to small apartments generally occurring in Custodial Care that may have some domestic cooking
appliances, while Group 1-2 Medical Care has sleeping rooms where cooking is prohibited in the rooms. It is also due to
resident to staff ratios that are generally less in Custodial Care than Group 1-2 Medical Care during night time.
Group I-1/R-4 Condition 2 & Group 1-2 difference: Group I-1 and R-4 Condition 2 occupancies through state licensing
agencies, do not allow residents that must remain in bed during emergency evacuation, so Group 1-2 increased means of
egress width requirements in Chapter 10 for bed movement are not applied.
Group I-1/R-4 Condition 2 & Group 1-2 differences: Other differences between traditional Group 1-2 occupancies
and new Group I-1 and R-4 Condition 2 occupancies are maintained due to differences between the types of care
provided (Medical Care versus Custodial Care), and other characteristics of the two occupancy groups. One example
is that Medical Care may have semiconscious or unconscious persons who are totally dependent on others for their
safety during emergencies. Custodial Care has persons who are conscious but may not be as functional or responsive
to emergencies as compared to the general population. These persons still have sufficient functional ability to participate in
evacuation with or without assistance. This aspect of the revised Group I-1 is also consistent with all state assisted living
regulations.

The type of IBC defined care that is provided (Medical or Custodial). The care level limits Group I-1 to provide
Custodial Care and does not allow the higher resident acuity levels allowed in nursing facilities or hospitals (Medical
Care).

The type of evacuation process and evacuation capability that is allowed in Custodial Care versus Medical
Care. It limits Custodlal Care to residents that may require limited assistance in evacuation but who are capable of
actively participating in complete building evacuation versus the defend in place concept for Medical Care

That they receive care on a 24 hour basis as defined.

Sectlon 202 - Custodial Care. The revision to the custodlal care definition clarifies the difference between custodial care and
medical care. Medical care allows for defend in place as is proposed by the ICC Ad Hoc Committee on Healthcare. The revised text
clarifies that custodial care includes persons that can still respond to emergencies at a slower rate than the general population for
complete building evacuation, due to mental, psychiatric or physical complications.

Section 308.3 Group I-1 is revised to allow persons who can respond to an emergency situation with or without asslstance
from others. Assisted living is the largest use group of the custodial care uses with over 32,000 facilities. Currently nearly all state
licensing agencies allow a majority of their assisted living classifications to have residents that may require limited assistance from
others during emergency evacuation. There are also numerous other uses in Group I-1 that have all persons that can evacuation on
their own with assistance from others. The "Condition" concept is utilized from the Group 1-3 detention occupancy to differentiate
Group I-1 occupancies between needing assistance and not needing assistance in evacuation.

Many assisted living, residential care, and some group home faciiities have some residents that may fall under the following
limited assistance with evacuation condition as paraphrased from the NFPA 101A Guide on Alternative Approaches to Life Safety.
This guide has been utilized by many states licensing agencies, starting since the early 1990's, to determine the relative emergency
evacuation capability of residents of custodial care types of residents, with or without assistance from others. It is used here to
show the relative nuances of evacuation assistance that will be included in custodial care in the IBC. The concepts are similar
as proposed herein, that the occupants still actively participate in fire drills and are trained to complete building evacuation during
emergencies, with or without assistance from others:

i

2



A person who has mild to more resistance or confusion to respond to an alarm, or needing someone to help them with
instructions as found with persons with dementia or persons with Alzheimer's.

A person needing extra intermediate or continuous help during their emergency evacuation.

A person who has some physical impalrment needing physical assistance to help them evacuate.

A person who needs some assistance getting out of bed or is considered not self starting, but can continue with or without
assistance in building evacuation.

A person with seconds or even a few minutes of impaired consciousness intermittently a few times over a few months
due to medications or illness.

A person requiring minor or constant supervision or attention to help them receive, comprehend, and follow through
instructions during emergencies.

A person who is on medications, or even exceptionally sound sleepers, making them have some chance of not having a
waking response to an alarm.

All persons still have the capability level to participate in emergency evacuation with or without assistance from
others.

Section 420.4 Smoke barriers are added as a requirement in the Group I-1 Condition 2. Smoke barriers are added due to new
proposed resident type allowed and to create similar requirements as Group 1-2. Compartmentalization is a key aspect of
occupancies with occupants who may need assistance with evacuation. There are also state licensing regulations in a majority of
states requiring smoke barriers in their assisted living facilities. The smoke barrier sections utilize and match technical requirements,
language and format from the current 1-2 Section 407 for smoke barriers. The smoke compartment area matches the current area
limit.

Section 420.4.1 Matches the format and requirements of the smoke barrier requirements from Section 407. The 15 square feet
refuge area is smaller than the Group 1-2 refuge area requirements due to no bedridden residents being allowed in custodial care
uses by all state regulatory agencies. The 15 square feet matches over the one third of states that have similar state assisted living
refuge areas in their licensing life safety regulations compared to this custodial care proposal.

The "sleeping rooms" are also removed as a refuge area space as compared to Group 1-2. This is appropriate because
custodial care often includes apartments or sleeping rooms that have domestic cooking facilities with the associated room and
corridor smoke and fire separation requirements included in Group I-1 and R. This is also another difference between custodlal care
and medical care.

(IFC) Section 420.5 and 420.6 The current Section "420.4 Automatic sprinkler system" is moved to Section 420.5 as a clerical
change due to the new proposed added sections prior. The current Section "420.5 Smoke detection and fire alarm system" is
moved to section 420.6 as a clerical change due to the new proposed added sections prior. There are proposed clerical
changes to the new section 420.6 that add all of the actual occupancies cross-referenced in the sections referenced in the section.

Section 504.2 requires that the new Group I-1 and R-4 Condition 2 not be allowed to use sprinklers for story Increases in
Type IIB, Ill, IV, or V construction, matching the current exception for Group 1-2. The limitation is proposed due to the new resident
type. It is also because about 30 states licensing agencies already limit their custodial care facilities with residents needing
assistance with evacuation to less than the four stories that are currently allowed in Group I-1 In the combustible construction
types.

Oregon has had no multiple fire death fires in over 100 buildings using these concepts and requirements, and all fires were
contained.

(IFC) Section 903.2.6 requires full NFPA 13 sprinkler coverage in the Group I-1 Condition 2 facility fire areas. The NFPA 13
requirement is added due to the new proposed resident type allowed. Full sprinkler coverage provided by a NFPA 13 system is a
key aspect of larger occupancies with residents needing some assistance with evacuation. Currently over half the states licensing
agencies already require NFPA 13 sprinklers in their large assisted living facilities with residents needing assistance with
evacuation. The exception is revised to allow NFPA 13R In other Group I-1 Condition 1 facilities, maintaining the current exception
for the current capable Group I-1 uses. The exception number 2 is deleted since a NFPA 13D system for single family residential or
other small facilities was never intended to be allowed in and Group I-1 facility serving more than 16 residents, irrelevant of whether
they require assistance with evacuation.

(IFC) Section 903.2.8.3 is revised to allow for the new R-4 Condition 2 occupancy. The R-4 Condition 2 occupancy would have
both an NFPA13R sprinkler system required as well as added attic protection. In attics not used for living purposes, storage or
fuel fired equipment, there are four options offered. Either the smoke detection system will provide early warning of an attic fire, or
the chance of a fire in the attic is reduced by construction or sprinklers. Automatic sprinklers in the unheated attic space would
have a freezing issue in group homes in northern climates, so additional options are necessary.

i3



(IFC) Section 907.2.6.1 is revised to eliminate the smoke detection exception only in buildings housing Group I-1 Condition 2
occupancles. This proposal still allows the exception to be applied to other buiidings with Group I-1 Condition 1 as defined by fire
walls or exterior walls.

Section 1018.1 Corridor Construction is revised to allow halls within dwelling units in Group I-1 be non-rated just like R
occupancies as a missed oversight from previous editions of the code.

1.  Industry representatives confirmed in information provided to the CTC that custodial care and especially assisted
living/ residential care IBC occupancy classification varies greatly across the country. Industry substantiated that it is
mostly due to the IBC stating that only occupants who can evacuate on their own occur in IBC custodial care
occupancies versus what actually occurs nationally. This conflict then causes some custodial care to be classified
as a hybrid of Group I-1 and 1-2 in states amending the IBC, some classified as Group 1-2, some classified as
general I1 or 1-2 hybrids in states enforcing other varying standards (NFPA 101), some individual projects applying
alternative means creating a hybrid occupancy, and some miss-applying the capability standard. The industry
representatives were associated with the American Health Care Association, Assisted Living Federation of
America, and Leading Age as the three industry trade associations representing almost all assisted living/
residentiai care in the country.

Cost Impact: The proposed changes will not increase the cost of construction. Reduction



Summary Timeline of
Assisted Living

Building & Life Safety Code Regulation

By Dan Purgiel

Building Codes State Building Codes NFPA 101
(Created by George Crosier/ Roger Severson & Others)
1990 UBC/ BOCA/ SBC ~ 1990 Oregon 1988 NFPA 101 -
(Not covered) Used concepts of NFPA 101 RB&C
Allowed evacuation assistance Residential Board & Care concepts
Allowed NFPA 13 D in slow small & timing of slow, prompt and
Allowed NFPA 13 R in slow large impractical allowing evacuation
Required NFPA 13 in impractical assistance in small(<16) and large
Required smoke barriers in large (>16) residential settings.
Large Impractical required
conformance to Health Care/ Limited
Care.
Slow and Prompt conformed to
Residential Board and Care
1991 NFPA 101
g 1994 NFPA 101
1990’s 1997 NFPA 101
California, New Jersey, New York,
Virginia, Washington started modifying
their state codes to allow for non-nursing
facility uses with persons needing
assistance
2000 IBC 2000 NFPA 101
Created assisted living occupancies of
I-1/ R-4 but did not allow evacuation
assistance which most state licensing
agencies allowed. Instead made them
95% just like apartment occupancies.
2003 IBC 2003 2003 NFPA 101
Dan Purgiel became committee member | Eliminated timing in new construction
that produced Oregon building codeto | and assumed all large are impractical
convert IBC format to incorporate NFPA levels.
101 RB&C concepts for assisted living. Allowed evacuation assistance with
no timing, required NFPA 13, smoke
barriers, and 2 story wood frame
limits
2006 IBC

2007 OSSC

2006 NFPA 101 13




Recent Summary of National Changes

For Assisted Living
By Daniel Purgiel

State and IBC Changes

NFPA 101

2009 IBC

IBC continues classifying
assisted living contrary to
what all states allow in
terms of resident type.

20121BC

2007

State of Hawaii hired LRS (Dan Purgiel) to review their AL requirements by comparing them
to national state of industry. Dan Purgiel provided national analysis showing that the IBC
assisted living occupancies worked exclusively in less than 5 states. Concluded in analysis
that the IBC assisted living is misclassified by not allowing the resident type that all the states
allow.

2008

State of Hawaii accepted Dan Purgiel recommendations of paralleling NFPA and Oregon
concepts for assisted living regulation in their building code. (Not enforced until 2011.)

2008-2009

Dan Purgiel used ICC contacts from Hawail hearing (Craig Stevenson & Kevin Scott) to
propose a national solution for the IBC through the ICC (Code Action Committee) CAC. It was
later determined that the proposal could not go through CAC.

Dan Purgiel wrote a single proponent proposal (G-21-12) with technical help from ex City of

101 concept in IBC format.
Dan Purgiel reached out to industry and met Tom Jaeger (NFPA-AAHSA-HCA) and Maribeth

Bersani (ALFA). ALFA hired him to push national change due to national relevance of issue.
Both co sponsored public comment version of G-21.

2009 ICC Hearings

The ICC CTC (Code Technical Committee) was supposed to deal with assisted living issues
and already had a minor proposal 2 years in the making. Dan Purgiel and Tom Jaeger made
them aware of misclassification issue but were too late to gain enough support to include in
the CTC proposal for such a major change. Did gain support from FCAC members mostly
due to reaching out to various parties. Final action vote in Baltimore needed 67% vote but

+| only got 57%. The CTC was only group that spoke minorly against. Gained key moral support

.of CTC member Wayne Jewel and Dave Collins (AIA). Afterward they said they would help
during next 2012-13 code change cycle.

Portiand now ICC Kermit Robinson. Dan Purgiel conceived 5 options but used similar NFPA

2011

Tom Jaeger and Dan Purgiel gained CTC member support to form special CTC Care Study
Group to propose solutions for assisted living and nursing during the 2012-13 code change
cycle. Hospitals were moved to specially formed Ad Hoc committee.

CTC members Wayne Jewel (Ml BO-Condition concept), Kim Paarlberg (ICC code technical
writer), Tom Jaeger, Bob Davidson, Emory Rogers, Ed Altizer and others critiqued and
revised Dan Purgiel's original proposal and made it technically better over 4 months of weekly

conference calls.

2012

The G-31 assisted living won approval in Dallas with no modifications and received no public
comment, mostly due to all the specialists on the committee and their national presence of
winning support for the proposal.

G-31 Approved on Final Action Consent Agenda in Portland in October 2012.

20151BC

Parallels NFPA 101
concepts under IBC
format

2013
Evacuation drills changes proposed in IFC based on G-31
A few states GA, NY, OR, VA may implement G-31 in 2013/14.

Dan Purgiel continues to help entities due to the misalignment of assisted living in
codes.

2009 NFPA 101

2012 NFPA 101

2015 NFPA 101

16




2012 NFPA 101
New Construction Large Residential Board & Care (RB&C)
to Health Care (HC)

Comparisons
LEGEND: = Grey Fill = MORE Protection Required

Residential Board & Care - Assisted Living

Staged Assistance with Evacuation
RB&C: >16 Large/ Slower / Assist with Evacuation/ Conscious
RB&C: 6-16 Smalll Slower / Assist with Evacuation/ Conscious

Staged Evacuation with Assistance

Health Care — Nursing - Hospital

Defend in Place
HC: >5 Incapable
Incapable of Self Preservation/
Semi Conscious to Unconscious
Bedridden/ Life Support
Defend in Place

+/-35,000 assisted living facilities regulated in 50 states under
individual State regulations

+-17,000 nursing facilities regulated in all 50 states under
Federal regulations.

About every state allows assisted living/ residential care
facilities with residents requiring evacuation assistance

All Health Care facilities are considered
Incapable of Self Preservation

Higher resident acuity levels

Lower resident/ occupant acuity levels

Bedfast not allowed. Residents confined to bed during short term
iliness, are still able to be transferred out of bed into wheelchair,
walker or on their own during emergencies.

Bedfast allowed and common.

Some occupants, especially when on life support systems, may
not be preferred to be moved out of bed during emergencies.

Night time staff to resident ratio generally:+/- 1:20 to 1:30

Night time staff to resident ratio generally: +/- 1:8 to 1:15

Smoke Barriers required

No Open space to carridor exceptions.
{Less staff)

No exceptions for corridor and door smoke protection.

- Smoke Partition between units
(Less staffl Dwelling Units)

Smoke Barriers required

Open space to corridor allowed
(More staff and Defend In Place)

No corridor and door rating by exception. (More staff)

No separation between units
(More staff/ Sleeping Room only)

Sprinkler story limitation
2 stories Type VA,

Sprinkler story limitation
1 story Type VA, 3in Type lIA

NFPA 13 sprinklers
For large facilities (>16)/ 13R/ D for small facilities (6-16)
Smoke detection required [n common spaces. No exception
(Less staff/ Dwelling Units)
Smoke alarms required
(Less staff/ Dwelling Units)

NFPA 13 sprinklers

NO Smoke detection by exception_allowed in common spaces.
(More staff/ Sleeping Room only)
No smoke alarms required
(More staff/ Sleeping Room only)

NO suite exception to corridor protection allowed.
(Less staff/ Dwelling Units)
‘Rated smoke partition corridors
(Less stafff Dwelling Units)
No bedfast corridor width

(No bedfast allowed, resulting in no bed movement during
emergencies. No life support &llowed)

Suites allowed
(More staff/ Sleeping Room only )
No rated corridor and doors
(More staff/ Sleeping Room only)
Bedfast corridor width
" (Bedfast/ bed movement/ life support allowed)

17




Elder Care Resident Profile Guide for Proposed 2015 Related Codes” %3

Retirement/ Assisted Living/ Residential Care® Nursing

Apartments

Independent Minimum Standby Hands-on Total Assistance

(Most Residents) Assistance Assistance Assistance {(Many Residents)
(Some Residents) (Some Residents) (Some Residents)

IBC: R-2?
No defined IBC care

IBC:I-1 Condition 12
IBC: Custodial Care

IBC:I-1 Condition 2*
IBC: Custodial Care

IBC: 1-1 Condition 2 2
IBC: Custodial Care

IBC: 1-2 Condition 1 2
IBC: Medical Care

NFPA: Apartments?

NFPA: Board & Care?

NFPA: Board & Care?

NFPA: Board & Care?

NFPA: Health Care?

Able to respond Able to respond in an Needs standby Needs assistance in an Needs complete

independently in an Emergency. assistance in an emergency. assistance in an

emergency. (Self Evacuation) emergency. (Assisted Staged emergency.

(Self Evacuation) (Assnsteq Staged Evacuation) (Defend in Place)
Evacuation)

Able to negotiate Walks Standby stair Stair assistance Stair assistance not

stairs in an
emergency and exit
the building

independently in
emergency, infrequent
falls

assistance during
emergency. Some with
fall risk

during emergency. Some
with fall risk

preferred approach due to
many being bedridden

Transfers from bed

Transfers from bed

Standby assist from

Assistance from bed to

May be completely

independently independently bed may be needed wheelchair or walker may | bedfast. Movement from
be needed during bed may not be preferred-
emergencies Hospitals. 2 person assist
or mechanical lift may be
needed
ADL (Acts of Daily, « | ADL- ADL - ADL - ADL -
Living) - Resident is Independent to verbal Reminders to giving Verbal cues and/or hands- | Hands-on assistance
able to accomplish reminders verbal cues on assistance
all without assistance
from staff
Eats and takes Independent with Medication Medication Medication adjustments
medications medications & reminders and management and
Dr. appointments management behavior management
Capable of own toileting | Continent of Occasional Incontinence Incontinence -
and bowel and incontinence management management
personal hygiene bladder assistance
Bathes, dresses, ’ Independent in Bathing set up Bathing Bathing assistance
grooms | bathing and monitoring assistance

Meals/housekeeping
provided, if chosen.
No personal care
assistance or
monitoring

Meals, nutrition and
housekeeping
assistance is helpful

Meals, nutrition and
housekeeping
assistance is helpful

Meals, nutrition and
housekeeping
assistance is needed

Verbal cues and
hands-on
assistance to eat

Would benefit from Able to Reminders and Encourage and Encourage and
socialization and independently encouragement escort to participate in escort to activities
activities with minor plan and participate in | to participate in activities
encouragement social activities activities
No memory Little memory Mild memory Impaired Needs 24 hour nursing
impairment impairment impairment - memory, poor supervision or skilled

: sometimes orientation and services such as physical,

disoriented confusion occupational and/or
speech therapy
Capacity for decision- Some decline in Declining Limited capacity and Limited or no
making and . capacity for self care capacity for self some to more inability to | capacity for self
understanding and understanding care and understand care and understanding of
consequences consequences of understanding consequences of actions | consequences of actions
actions consequences

Family does not Family "slightly Family Family "very concerned" - Family must do
"need” to move concerned" "concerned" "Have to do something" :

something 1

Edited and enhanced from Nevada Elder Care Assisted Living Guidelines 2006 by Dan Purgiel.

This analysls preliminary assumed occupancy designations from the proposed 2015 IBC and 2012 NFPA 101.
This guide assumes general conditions of residents in the United States. Individual

conditions of residents mav varv from the aeneral conditions stated in the table.

State regulatory agencies requirements of




(0L#) seale ssa (0L#) seale ssa (0L#) seale jsopy (0L#) seale 1sopy uonos9la(qg Howsg
(0L#) ON (0L 'e#) ON (0L ‘€ #)saA (01 ‘e#) saA uoyjeledag Buides|g
(01#) ON (0L ‘e#) ON (0L ‘e#) soA (01 ‘e#) SeA lopliio) pajey
(9#) seA (9#) seA (9#) ON (9#) oN YIPIM ssa1b3 pappy

(1L ‘v#) €1 VdAN

(L1 ‘v#) €1 VdAN

(L1 ‘v#) €1 VdAN

(L1 ‘v#) "EL 10 AEL VAN

walsAg Japjuudg

&0>on<
wugiod (#)

Jad uoseay yym)
uonipuod
a|109dg
pajeloossy 9

(9°G 'v#) SAA (9 'S 'p#) SO (L1 '9'S 'v#) SAA (9'S 'v#) ON sjuswpedwo) ajows| [sjusweiinbay og|
3oe|d ur puseqg 33e|d Ul puslag uoijendeA] pabeig UONENOBAT 95 asuodsay uonenaeaz| 1
}saybiH JaybiH wnpaiy BMo ofjey Juapisay o} jjels| o0l
wia ] Hoys wie | Buo pue woyg wia] BuoT wis | BuoT Aeyg jo yibuag| 6
SOA SOA SOA SOA Aeis InoH ¥z| 8| sjuepisay jyeis
Aloje|nquie-uoN Aloje|nquie-uoN Aloje|nquie-uop awog Aoje|nquuy jjem o0} ajqy
wa ] Hoys Auepy jAioje|nquiy Auepy Ajlessuag) :Aoyenquiy| 2
"SW9JSAS ‘swaysAs poddns ay) , ‘Papaau
HOddns 8y ‘ JUSWSAOW  |uo ma) Asan * JUSUWISAOW paq| JUSWSAOW paq o jng paq
P39 yum 1sejpaq Uim jseypaq Jo uappupag | ul pauljuod Ajuelodws) awos
‘sioyjem ‘slieydlasypy | DUIOS ‘SI9Y|eM ‘SIHBUDI9BYAA | ‘SJad[Em ‘SNIBYDleaymM SWOS | SISNEM ‘SIBUDI9aUyM WO as aolnag poddng| 9
*Jlos 0} ysu "S19YJ0 JO J|OS 0} YSi pajiw|
‘syjuawiedwt ‘aaisuodsal ‘slay)o 1o Ulim awos pue ‘sjusuniedut *SJay)o 10 J|as 0} ysu
1o [euojouny Jou 4198 0] )s yim ‘sjuauriredun Uim ‘anisuodsal Ajleniul [ewiuiw pue ‘Jusuuiedw) spy|
‘SNOIJSUODUN JO SNOIOSUOD |yjim ‘BAISUOdSSI 10 [euolounjjl aq jou Aew TTEUONOUN} SS8] 9q | Ypm ‘BAISUOdSaJ '[euonouny Ayjeuoijoung
WSS aq Aew sjualjed 3q 10U ABW S)uapisay AeuW ‘SNoSU0D aJe S)uapisay [TSRODSUOD A[[N] aJe sjuspisay juednaosp| s
uoneAlasald JIes uoneAlasald oS UONENJBAd UlIM S0UB]SISSE UONENJEAS J|9s
10 3|gededu] Auey 10 8|qededu| Auepy Buunbal awog Jo 9|qedes ¢ Angeden uopgenseany| ¢ Anjiqeden
L00J Uf Bupjood pa)yiwi| Alap
"WOO0J U] bupjo0oo ON “WOO0J U] BUB00d ON ‘woou Buides|s w001 Ul Bunj00d awog ealy Buidas|g
‘wool buides|g ‘woo. buidas|g Jo jiFjuswpede |lewg ‘yt-uswede jlewg /BuinitjoadA]] ¢
31e]) [edIpap a1e7) [edIpai aIe)) [eIpoysny) ale) |eipoisn)
pasinedng pasialadng pasialadng pasiaadng alenjoadA)| ¢
SOMI9ISqO {Xojag-uon)
Xx039q aie)) [efjuapisay owiog I9jua) bniQg pue |oyod|y
Kaebing aie) s JeuiPyz|y SWOH AemjeH
[eldsoH 9WwoH buisinN BUIAT] pajsSISSY ISON awioH dnolg salijioeq jo sadA1| | sBuidnoug
uoflpuo) osyioedg|, # JeJauag
¢ uonipuod I uonipuo)y ¢ uonipuo)p | uonipuop uoniipuod odi
Z-1 dnoig ¢+, (p-d) L[ dNoI9H sajouednaaQ ale) g1 5102 uwwono._M_

i

0dI G102 8y} 104 Z|-LGZ9 pue ZL-LeD pasodold ayj} 10} aping XUje| sanijioe aled




D
el
"sjuawalinbal g uonipuo?) o)

soue|dwod pue abueyd Aouednooo ue annbai pjnom sjuednooo g uolipuod o} SaBUBYD aINjny 8|GISSOd “UOHBOLISSED | UOHIPUOY) B 10} SMO|[E uoyjesisselo Aouabe
Buisusoil ay) Jeyy sbuime.p uoneondde ywiad ay) UO UMOYS S| )i SSBjUN ‘Z UOIPUOY |-| dNOLS) Se palSSEe|D aq pinoys suoneoiidde aled [enuapisal abie| swos pue
Buinyl pejsisse abuel |le Jsow|y "apIng XielN ale) siy) ut pajou suoneyw|| [eiauab ay) 1oy }1daoxa ‘p-y 10 |-| dnous) ul pajsi| sesn asay) Jo Auew ajenbal 1o ‘Agsselo
‘aweu Allenpiapu) ssousbe Bujsusdll moy uo Aous)sISUOD [BUOIEU JOBXS OU St 818U "p-Y PUB ‘g-| ‘|-| Sdnolo) Jepun sasn paweu Ajjeoyoads ouauab sisit D9l /Ul

‘suoneinba. Aouabe Buisuady ay) o) Bunela.iod pue Hgj 8y ul paulyap se SISeq JNoY g B U0 a1ed aA19%al Asy) Jayleypm v
"suoneywi| pue suone|nbai Aousbe Buisusdl) ey} 0} Bunelsrioo sjuednado ay) jo Alliqeded uonenoeas Aouabiawe Dgjayl g
"saljl|ioey a1e9 jo sadA
asay} ur punoy euajo ubisap o10ads pue ‘sians)| Aliiiqedes ‘sedA) Juednooo ‘aled ‘uoisiaadns Jo syoadse Bulayip ‘UONEIapISUOD Ojul SaYE) Sjuswalinbal
a1e2 Jo adA) Og| 8y “suolejwi pue suonenbas Aousbe Buisusoll ay) o) Bulje|a.i09 (jeuosiad Jo ‘[eIpoIsNy ‘[edipaly) aied pauyep gl Jo adAl syl g
‘aleo Bujaeoal suosiad Jo
Jaquinu pue ‘asn ‘uonipuod ‘Aouednado gl psiels ay) o} Bune|aliod uay) ‘uonenbai Aouabe Buisuaol ay) Aq paynuapl se Ajjioey pasuadl| jo adA) oexa ay] |
:5)daouod uofjezysjoeleyo
0dl pasodo.d Buimoljoy ay) uo paseq sajouednodo asey) Joj spienbajes Alojenbal sapiaoid pue ‘sazisjoeleyo ‘salyissed seuednooo alea 9gj pasodoud ayl

"Aiiqeded uonenoeaa pue ‘aled Butatesal suosiad Jo saquinu ‘adA)
aled *asn ‘uonipuod ‘Aouednodo Ogl 0} Bunelelioo uonenbal pajejs. pue uoneslysselo Aouabe Buisuadl| ayoads Ayjuaps pinoys sbumelp uoneoydde yuuad Butping
"suonipuod pue sdnoJb Aouednodo auea Dg| 8y} sjenualaylp Jey) molaq pajs| S}deduod UOHEZLISIORIBYD UO Paseq aq PINoys uoneoyissero Aouednooo Aypioe;) aleo v

‘Aouednooo Jo abueyd e palopisuod

8q Os|e p|noys uonIpuod e Jo abueyds vy "uolpuod ay) pue ‘asn ‘Aouednodo ay) yjoq sy} ajess pinoys ywiad Aouednooo [euy pue uoneoidde yuued Buiping Apoey
aled v "Og| 8y} ul sjuswalnbal pajefas |esauab sy pue sasn p-y pue ‘z- ‘i-| dnolg jo sadA) asay) Jo uoneziobales ay) Jo S}oadse SNOUEA SaYNUSP! XLIBLW By |
‘so|ouabe [esopay Jo/pue ajejs Aq pasuadl| pue psjenbal uayo ale Jey) -y Pue g-| ‘L-| Sdnolo uj Sasn SNOLEA aU) SMOYS SpINS Xijepy sanioe a1eq pasodoud ay |
uopjeoyyisse|) Asuednaap pasodoid pue aping xujep aled 9g| 610z pesodoid

"Jleydojesym e 0} Jodsued} 1oy mojje jou op Jey) sueaw Jay)o Jo uoddns ay| uo Buiaq o} anp saiouabiews Bulnp paq

0.y paAOLLBL 8q JOU pINOYS pue Jsejpaq aq Aew aied [ed1papy ul sjuednooo swog “saousbiows Buunp juswanow paq alnbal Aew syuednoaoo ale) [eoIpajy  °G
‘uonendoeas Asusbiawsa Buunp paq o Jno Bumab Jaje s)enquie ued usy) Jo ‘19¥[eM “JIBUD|98UM B O)UI Paq JO INO Pa)SISSE

8Q Ued Jnq uspplipaq Ajielodwa) aq Aew aled [e1pojsn) Ul sjuednodo awog serpusbiawa Bulnp juswesow paq ainbal jou op syuednooo ale) [elposng ‘i
"uoj09j0.d ONjje jeuonippe ajepuew sjuswaJlinbal g uolpuon $-y dnolo

"0l 8y} ul paje}s se uonoasjold ssa) 1oj Buimolle usy) ‘sjuapisal Jo Jaquinu sy} 1oy }dsoxe |-| dnolo) Se awes ay) aJe Z PUB | UOlIpUo) p-y dnois ‘g

"UMOUS 8.e UONE[S.1102 3y} Jo sjoadse awos AUQ “Xijew 8y} Jo wohoq 8y} je smod psenbajes Juswalinbay Dgl, 8Y) YlMm S8)eje.I00 Uwn(od 4, XIJew ay| 'z

"Xijew auj} ul satouednooo Jo Aouednooo jusoelpe ay) woy s81ouednado 10 Aouednooo pajou By} USaMISq SBoUBISHIP UBW By} SaIUSPI 1Xa) aulspun  °L

$8j0Uj004 3pIN9 xuJe ale) Hg| G510z pesodoid



2015 IBC Group I-1 Custodial Care Requirements .

Compared to Group I-2 Medical Care Table
Approved G31-12 Code Change for the 2015 IBC by the
ICC Code Technology Committee- Care Study Group e o

The G-31-12 for Groups I-1 and R-4 adds Condition 1, matching current self evacuation and protection requirements.
It also adds a new Condition 2 allowing evacuation _assistance with new protection features noted in the table below.

TABLE LEGEND:
(+ +) & Underline = Proposed IBC Change or Requirement
Grey Fill = MORE Protection Required: (New I-1 Conditioii 2 is more stringent than I-2 in the 7 grey sections)
(Parenthesis notes state comparison between -1 and I-2 and / or reason, or as specifically noted for R-4)

I-1_Condition 2 - Evacuation Assistance -2
Custodial Care - Assisted Living Medical Care - Nursing & Hospitals
I-1 Condition 2: >16 Slower / limited evacuation assistance/ Incapable of self preservation / some on life support or semi or
conscious J unconscious
R-4 Condition 2: 6-16 Slower /limited evacuation assistance/ consciou Defend in Place-non participation in regular fire drills

Staged Evacuation-Trained and participate in regular fire drills

About every state allows assisted living/ residential care facilities All Medical Care facilities are considered
with residents requiring evacuation assistance Incapable of Self Preservation
+/-35,000 assisted living facilities regulated in 50 states under individual +/-17,000 nursing facilities regulated in all 50 states under
State regulations Federal regulations.
Higher resident acuity levels than Medical Care Lower resident/ occupant acuity levels than Custodial Care
Bed transfers only allowed by some states Bedridden and Bedfast allowed and common
Residents confined to bied Juring short term iliness, as in the general Some occupants are bedfast, especially when on life support
public, can be helped out of bed into wheelchair, walker or on their own systems, and should remain in bed during emergencies or if
during emergencies: Non self starter only allowed. No bedfast allowed. emergency movement is required.
(+ +) Ch 4: Smoke Barriers for I-1 Condition 2 required Ch 4: Smoke Barriers required
For evacuation assistance facilities/ Staged evacuation (Acuity of residents / Defend in Place)
Ch 4: No Open Space to corridor exceptions in I-1 or R-4 Ch 4: Open space to corridor allowed
(Lower staff ratios than nursing) (Higher staff ratios than assisted living/ Defend In Place)
CH 4: No Exceptions for omitting corridor and door rating for I-1 or R-4 CH 4: No corridor and door réfing by exception.
(Generally apartments with limited cooking/ Lower staff ratios) (Higher staff ratios/ Defend in Place)
Ch 4: Fire Partitions between units in -1 and R-4 Ch 4: No Fire Partiions between units
(Generally apartments with limited cooking/ Lower staff ratios) (Sleeping rooms/ No cooking/ Higher staff ratios/ Defend in Place)
Ch &: (+ +) No sprinkler story increase allowed for Ch 5: No sprinkler story increase allowed
I-1 Condition 2 evacuation assistance facilities 1 story Type VA, 3 in Type IlA
3 stories Type VA, 4 stories for Type lIA ; : L .
{+ +) Ch 9: NFPA 13 Sprinklers - Ch 9: NFPA 13 sprinklers
for I-1 Condition 2 evacuation assistance facilities (Higher acuity residents / Defend in Place)

(13R/D for others and R-4 with options for added attic protection in
R-4 Condition 2 with evacuation assistance)

H(+ +)CHY: Smoke Detectlon In common spaces and comdors in I-1 and R CH 9: NO Smoke detection not required in common spaces and
4 corridors, by exception.
No sprinkler excegtlon for l-1 Condltlon 2 evacuation assistance facilities. (Higher staff ratios/ Defend in Place)
(Allowmg evacuation assistanc residents/ Lower staff ratios)
CH 9: Smoke Alarms required in |-1 and R-4 CH 9: NO smoke alarms required
(Generally apartments with very limited cooking/ Lower staff ratios) (Sleeping rooms/ No cooking/ Higher staff ratios/ Defend in Place)
CH 10: No Suite Exceptioh to corridor protection allowed for I-1 or R-4 CH 10: Suites allowed
(Lower staff ratios) (Higher staff ratios)
Ch 10: Rated Corridors and Poors in |-1 and R-4 : Ch 10: NO rated corridors and doors
(Generally apartments with limited cooking/ Lower staff ratios) (Sleeping rooms/ No cooking/ ngher staff ratios/ Defend in Place)
CH 10: No bed movement corridor width in -1 or R- 4 . CH 10; Bed movement corridor width,
(Can be assisted out of bed during emergencies/ No life support) (Some must remain in bed during emergencies/ Life sug;ﬂ
Ch 16: No structural redundancy in I-1 or R-4 Ch 16: Structural redundancy required with limits

(Staged evacuation/ No bed movement or life support) (Defend in Place/ Bed movement and some on life support)




CTC SUPPORTING DOCUMENTA'_I'ION
FOR G31 -12 (2015 IBC)

Groups |-1/R-4 Custodial Care Compared to Group I-2 Health Care
The Following is a Further Edited Excerpt from the Reason Statement for G31 - 12

The table illustrates the resulting provisions of G31-12 compared to the requirements for Group I-2. It illustrates that the
proposed G-31, allowing evacuation assistance with additional protection features, is appropriate for Custodial Care. It
shows that some key provisions of the new proposed Group I-1 are more stringent than Group I-2 requirements. They
include corridor protection and additional smoke detection and alarms that Group I-2 does not require. These additional
protection features plus the added NFPA 13 sprinklers and smoke barriers make the I-1 Condition 2 more appropriate for
Custodial Care and assisted living, considering design, resident acuity and staff levels.

The current IBC requires all occupants receiving Custodial Care to be able to evacuate on their own without any assistance
from others. Most state Custodial Care (assisted living/ residential care) licensing agencies allow occupants who require
assistance with evacuation. The lack of consistency between what the states allow and the existing IBC Custodial Care
provisions causes inconsistent application of the IBC. This proposal resolves that conflict and will result in more consistent
application of the code. The proposal integrates allowing both residents who require limited assistance with evacuation and
those that do not in Custodial Care occupancies. It accomplishes this while maintaining current residential occupancy
safeguards along with adding appropriate Group I-2 safeguards, for those requiring assistance with evacuation.

The proposed Group I-1 and R-4 custodial care revisions accomplish the following:

e It provides “condition classifications” for both Groups I-1 and R-4. It makes Condition 1 for the buildings, as
currently allowed, with residents capable of responding on their own during emergencies. It adds a Condition 2 for
buildings residents who may require assistance with evacuation.

» The added “condition” classification is already utilized in Group I-3 and is also proposed to be included in Group I-
2, under a separate proposal by the ICC Ad Hoc Committee on Healthcare.

e It adds to the new Group I-1 Condition 2, four more stringent requirements due to the new resident type allowed,
in addition to the existing current Group I-1 Condition 1 requirements: story limitations, smoke barriers, increased
sprinkler protection, and additional smoke detection.

» Itadds to the new Group R-4 Condition 2, due to the new resident type allowed, two more stringent requirements
in addition to the capable Group R-4 Condition 1 requirements: story limitations, and additional attic detection or
protection, considering the smaller facilities.

» lItleaves the other current IBC base I-1/ R-4 requirements, and the capable Group I-1 and R-4 Condition 1
requirements unchanged from the current code, except for minor clerical revisions.

e ltclarifies in the revised Custodial Care definition and in Group I-1 and R-4 Condition 2 occupancies that they are
not Group 1-2, which provides Medical Care. Group I-1 Custodial Care has persons with some physical or mental
limitations, who may require limited assistance in emergency evacuation, but who still participate in evacuation
drills for emergencies. This limit of the level of care or resident type in Group I-1 and R-4 does not include Group
I-2 higher acuity occupants who require full nursing care or Medical Care as defined, and do not participate in
evacuation drills for emergencies.

» Custodial Care assistance with evacuation is limited to include occupants who may not be self starting (needing
help out of bed during emergencies) but once out of bed can continue evacuation with or without assistance, in a
wheelchair, walker, or ambulating with or without assistance from others to an exit. Custodial Care assistance
with evacuation is limited to not include persons who must remain in bed during emergencies, requiring bed
movement, as is allowed in Medical Care.

» Custodial Care assistance with evacuation is limited to include occupants who are conscious, who can exit a
building with or without assistance from others during an emergency. Custodial Care assistance with evacuation
is limited to not include persons who are on life support or are semi or unconscious as is allowed in Medical Care.

» The prior stated limitations for assistance with evacuation for the revised Custodial Care match the limitations as
set forth by licensing agencies regulating the uses listed in Custodial Care. It is also consistent with the definitions
of care in the IBC for Medical Care and Custodial Care. Custodial Care evacuation will also be proposed to be
further defined in the proposed revisions to the 2015 IFC sections, for evacuation plans, and staff and resident
training.



